
FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 
 
Introducing "Kiki Can Fly" – A Heartwarming Animated Pre-School Series 
 
Aimed at Inspiring Young Minds Worldwide 
 
Adelaide, South Australia, 07/08/2024 – From the creator of “Hooroo the Kangaroo,” we are 
thrilled to announce the launch of "Kiki Can Fly," a delightful animated pre-school series 
designed for children aged 2 to 5 years. Murray Van, one of Australia's most experienced and 
successful illustrators, brings his legendary fun and dynamic style to life in this new series. With 
20 captivating 7-minute episodes, "Kiki Can Fly" is available in both English and French, ready to 
enchant young audiences around the globe. 
 
"Kiki Can Fly" follows the endearing journey of Kiki, a little bird with a big dream. Unlike her 
friends and family, Kiki faces the challenge of being unable to fly. However, her unwavering 
determination to join in the fun leads her on a heartwarming adventure. With the loving support 
of her father, who builds her a special plane, Kiki discovers the joy of soaring through the skies. 
Each episode presents a new challenge for Kiki to overcome, offering valuable lessons in 
resilience, creativity, and the power of friendship. 
 
Executive Producer, Michael Carrington says, “What truly sets Kiki Can Fly apart is its innovative 
storytelling through music. Co-creator and composer David Skinner has composed an original 
song that drives the narrative in each episode, immersing viewers in Kiki's world and enhancing 
the emotional impact of her experiences. This unique approach not only entertains but also 
inspires young viewers to embrace their individuality and pursue their dreams with confidence.” 
 
As we expand the Kiki brand, HooRoo Studio is dedicated to providing high-quality, imaginative 
licensing and merchandise that delights children while reinforcing the positive themes of the 
series. Through strategic partnerships and innovative product development, we aim to make Kiki 
a beloved and enduring presence in children's lives worldwide. 
 
We are excited to offer worldwide broadcast rights for "Kiki Can Fly." For acquisition inquiries, 
please contact us at michael@carrington.media  
 
Join Kiki on Her Soaring Adventures! 
 
For more information and to view a sneak peek of "Kiki Can Fly," visit our website at 
kikicanfly.com 
 
About HooRoo Studio: 
 
HooRoo Studio is a leading producer of high-quality children's programming, dedicated to 
creating content that entertains, educates, and inspires young audiences. With a focus on 
character and story, we strive to bring joy and wonder to children around the world. 
 
Contact: 
Michael Carrington, Executive Producer 
Carrington Media   
michael@carrington.media   
+61 (0)466 469 178 

https://www.kikicanfly.com/

